
23-009-SB Addendum 1

Musical Instruments

Issue Date: 9/19/2022

Questions Deadline: 10/7/2022 01:30 PM (CT)

Response Deadline: 10/21/2022 01:30 PM (CT)

Contact Information

Contact: Stephanie Bunford
Address: Purchasing Services

4
20430 Gator Lane
Land O' Lakes, FL 34638

Phone: (813) 794 x2225
Email: sbunford@pasco.k12.fl.us
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Event Information

Number: 23-009-SB Addendum 1
Title: Musical Instruments
Type: Request for Proposal
Issue Date: 9/19/2022
Question Deadline: 10/7/2022 01:30 PM (CT)
Response Deadline: 10/21/2022 01:30 PM (CT)
Notes: The intent of this RFP is to award a contract to multiple vendors for the purchase of

musical instruments.

Ship To Information

Address: Various Schools and Departments
FL

Billing Information

Contact: Accounts Payable
Address: 7227 Land O Lakes Blvd

Land O Lakes, FL 34638
Email: accountspayable@pasco.k12.fl.us

Bid Attachments

23-009-SB_Musical_Instrument_Specifications.pdf Download

Specifications Document

Standard_Terms_and_Conditions_20210715.pdf Download

Standard Terms and Conditions

Federal_Terms_and_Conditions_20191028.pdf Download

Federal Terms and Conditions

Principal Place of Business Form - Locked.pdf Download

Principal Place of Business Form

Drug-Free Workplace 20210715.pdf Download

Drug-Free Workplace

Conflict of Interest 20210715.pdf Download

Conflict of Interest Form

Requested Attachments

Principal Place of Business Form

PRINCIPAL PLACE OF BUSINESS FORM: Under the Attributes Tab in IonWave, please indicate if your principal place
of business is within the State of Florida. If your principal place of business is outside of the State of Florida, there is a
mandatory attachment that must be completed by an attorney and returned with your proposed response under the
“Response Attachments” tab in IonWave. Failure to comply will cause a vendor to be considered non-responsive to
the terms of this solicitation.
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https://pascok12.ionwave.net/extract.aspx?file=output%5Cpascok12%5C2022_10%5Cb711fb21-27c3-460a-94eb-764fce5ec3cb.pdf&name=23-009-SB_Musical_Instrument_Specifications.pdf
https://pascok12.ionwave.net/extract.aspx?file=output%5Cpascok12%5C2021_7%5Cc2af1efc-296e-474b-9802-9b2d8e33b023.pdf&name=Standard_Terms_and_Conditions_20210715.pdf
https://pascok12.ionwave.net/extract.aspx?file=output%5Cpascok12%5C2020_1%5Cb0d56cac-48a6-428d-8a5b-0d40652e57ef.pdf&name=Federal_Terms_and_Conditions_20191028.pdf
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https://pascok12.ionwave.net/extract.aspx?file=output%5Cpascok12%5C2021_7%5Cc5b6cac5-7b68-4a76-a93f-95adf1480daf.pdf&name=Conflict+of+Interest+20210715.pdf


Bid Attributes

1 Company Name

Provide company name, doing business as

 

 

 
(Required: Maximum 1000 characters allowed)

2 Certifying Official's Name and Title

Provide contact information of person approving documentation who is a certifying official of the company

 

 

 
(Required: Maximum 1000 characters allowed)

3 Address

Provide principal place of business address, including city, state and zip code

 

 

 
(Required: Maximum 1000 characters allowed)

4 Company Phone Number

Provide the best number for the company contact to be reached for this solicitation

(__ __ __) __ __ __ - __ __ __ __ ext:
(Required)

5 Email Information

Provide an email to be used for this solicitation

(Required: Email address)

6 District's Terms and Conditions

I have received and read the District’s Terms and Conditions.

 Yes, I have received and read the T&C's
(Required: Check if applicable)

7 Federal Terms and Conditions

I have received and read the Federal Terms and Conditions. 

 Yes, I have received and read the Federal T&C's
(Required: Check if applicable)

8 Purchases by other Public Agencies

With the consent and agreement of the successful bidder(s), purchases may be made under this bid by other
governmental agencies within the State of Florida. Such purchases shall be governed by the same terms and
conditions as stated herein. I affirm that any purchases made by other governmental agencies would not impact the
pricing submitted for this proposal.

 Agree   Decline
(Required: Check only one)
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9 Purchasing Card Payment Program

Please indicate your ability to accept purchasing card payments. Note any restrictions, additional fees, or
stipulations associated with the processing of purchasing cards. Accepting p-cards are not required.

 

 

 
(Required: Maximum 1000 characters allowed)

1
0

Purchase Order Receiving

Provide your preference if receiving purchase orders. Provide company standard email or mailing address.

 

 

 
(Required: Maximum 1000 characters allowed)

1
1

Conflict of Interest

Company must either certify that no official or employee of Pasco County Schools requiring the goods or services
described in these specifications has a material financial interest in this company OR certify that the following
named Pasco County Schools official(s) and/or employee(s) having material financial interest(s) (in excess of 5%) in
this company have filed Conflict of Interest Statements with the Supervisor of Elections, 14236 Sixth Street, Dade
City, Pasco County, Florida, 33523, prior to opening. hereunder relative to Florida State Statute 112.313(12).
Failure to execute either section may result in rejection of this bid.

 No, material financial interest in this company   Yes, financial interest(s) in excess of 5% - FORM
(Required: Check only one)

1
2

Drug-Free Workplace

Preference shall be given to businesses with drug-free workplace programs. I have read the qualification of a drug-
free workplace program and certify that this firm complies fully with the attached requirements.

 I certify our business as a drug-free workplace.
(Required: Check if applicable)

1
3

Principal Place of Business

Principal Place of Business - Please indicate if your principal place of business is within the State of Florida. OR If
your principal place of business is outside of the State of Florida, there is a mandatory attachment that must be
completed by an attorney and returned with your proposed response. Failure to comply will cause a vendor to be
considered non-responsive to the terms of this solicitation.

 Yes, Principal Place of Business - FL   No, Complete required form
(Required: Check only one)

1
4

Electronic Submittal Process

I understand that proposals for this solicitation must be submitted electronically via IonWave. Electronic submittals
are secure and unavailable for District review until after the closing date and time of the solicitation. Modifications
can be made to vendor submittals until the close date and time within IonWave.  Once the closing date and time has
passed, IonWave will no longer allow submittals.

 Assume responsibitity-date and time of submittal
(Required: Check if applicable)

1
5

Insurance, proof of coverage

Vendors must include proof of insurance coverage in their bid response. Once the bid is finalized, the awarded
vendor(s) must provide a certificate of coverage naming the District as the insured before the project start date or
within 30 days of awarding the bid, whichever is less. Terms and Conditions #45 provides additional information.

 I have attached proof of insurance coverage.
(Required: Check if applicable)
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1
6

Special Discounts/Promotions:

In the event special quantity discounts are applicable over and above the proposed prices/discounts (or special
promotion items become available), the successful vendors must advise the District in order to pass along
additional savings.

 Agree
(Required: Check if applicable)

1
7

Delivery:

All prices must be F.O.B. Destination, no delivery and/or handling charges will be added, freight prepaid and
included to the District School Board of Pasco County.

 Agree
(Required: Check if applicable)

1
8

Part A - Elementary Musical Instruments

Please indicate your choice for participation in Part A by selecting yes or no.  To be considered for award of Part A,
vendors must bid on instruments under the line item tab for this part.

 Yes   No
(Required: Check only one)

1
9

Part B Secondary Winds

Please indicate your choice for participation in Part B by selecting yes or no. To be considered for award of Part B,
vendors must bid on instruments under the line item tab for this part.

 Yes   No
(Required: Check only one)

2
0

Part C Secondary Percussion

Please indicate your choice for participation in Part C by selecting yes or no.  To be considered for award of Part C,
vendors must bid on instruments under the line item tab for this part.

 Yes   No
(Required: Check only one)

2
1

Part D String Instruments

Please indicate your choice for participation in Part D by selecting yes or no.  To be considered for award of Part D,
vendors must bid on instruments under the line item tab for this part.

 Yes   No
(Required: Check only one)

2
2

Category A - Cost (30 Point Max)

Cost will be evaluated based on the instruments listed in the Line Item tab in IonWave that most vendors have in
common. Points will be assessed using the weighted ratio of cost method for Category A.

 

Formula for weighted ratio of cost method: Lowest proposed price/vendor’s submitted price x 30

 

 Agree
(Required: Check if applicable)
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2
3

Category B - Ordering Process (15 Point Max)

In the text space, provide a narrative outlining your ordering process for evaluation purposes.  The narrative must
at a minimum include the following:

Explain your Method for receiving\shipping orders.

Can orders be placed on a website?
Information needed for a District School or Department to place an order.
 
There is a maximum of 4,000 characters allowed on this narrative.
 

The narratives submitted by each company will be evaluated by three (3) District staff members. They will be scored
by the evaluators scoring (1) Low-(5) High. Scores for the three (3) evaluators will be totaled with fifteen (15) being
the maximum number of points awarded for Category B. Purchasing Services staff will monitor the evaluation
process. 

 

 

 

 

 

 
(Required: Maximum 4000 characters allowed)

2
4

Category C - Company Qualifications (15 Point Max)

In 4,000 characters or less, describe your company’s background and qualifications as a distributor of musical
instruments. In addition, explain your experience with School Districts the size of Pasco Schools. Explain your
experience working directly with Pasco Schools.
 
The narratives submitted by each company will be evaluated by three (3) District staff members. They will be scored
by the evaluators scoring (1) Low-(5) High. Scores for the three (3) evaluators will be totaled with fifteen (15) being
the maximum number of points awarded for Category C. Purchasing Services staff will monitor the evaluation
process. 

 

 

 

 

 

 
(Required: Maximum 4000 characters allowed)
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2
5

Category D - Customer Service (15 Point Max)

In 4,000 characters or less, describe your company’s customer service support plan and include information on the
individual that would be designated as the primary point of contact and will be working directly with Pasco Schools.
 
The narratives submitted by each company will be evaluated by three (3) District staff members. They will be scored
by the evaluators scoring (1) Low-(5) High. Scores for the three (3) evaluators will be totaled with fifteen (15) being
the maximum number of points awarded for Category D. Purchasing Services staff will monitor the evaluation
process. 

 

 

 

 

 

 
(Required: Maximum 4000 characters allowed)

2
6

Signature / Authority to bind the company

I understand that all documents must be completed and signed by an officer or employee having the authority to
bind the company. The signing of documents by marking this checkbox certifies that I have read and agree to abide
by the accompanying cover letter, general terms and conditions, special terms and conditions, and specifications.
This sheet and the accompanying documents constitute a firm offer from the bidder; no separate document will be
negotiated or executed unless warranted by law or if deemed necessary by the District.

 I'm a person of authority to bind the company
(Required: Check if applicable)

Bid Lines

1 Package Header

Part A - Elementary Musical Instruments

Quantity: 1  Total: $

Supplier Notes:  

 
 No bid

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)

Package Attributes

1. Part A Line Items

This is not a line-item bid.  Instruments listed on the line item tab for Part A are examples of elementary
instruments the District purchases most often. Purchases utilizing this contract are not limited to the instruments
listed. Prices submitted will be used for evaluation purposes only. After award of this RFP, the schools and
departments will contact the vendors directly for quotes.  Purchasing that exceed $4,999.99 will require three (3)
quotes to be obtained from the awarded vendors. Vendors may be automatically disqualified if they are unable to
provide at least fifty percent (50%) of the instruments in Part A.

 I understand
(Required: Check if applicable)
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Package Items

1.1 Sand Blocks, pair, 5x3

Quantity: 1 UOM: each Price: $ Total: $

Manufacturer: Rhythm Band

Manufacturer #: RB753 or equal

Item Notes: Please include the manufacturer and manufacturer number of the
"or equal" in the Notes field for each line item.  If a note with a
different brand is not included, it will be assumed that the
instrument proposed is the specified brand.

Supplier Notes:  

 

 No bid

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)

1.2 Bells, Sleigh, 25-bell, on wooden handle

Quantity: 1 UOM: each Price: $ Total: $

Manufacturer: Basic Beat

Manufacturer #: BB25 or equal

Item Notes: Please include the manufacturer and manufacturer number of the
"or equal" in the Notes field for each line item.  If a note with a
different brand is not included, it will be assumed that the
instrument proposed is the specified brand.

Supplier Notes:  

 

 No bid

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)

1.3 Bells, Wrist, four bells on nylon strap, Velcro closure

Quantity: 1 UOM: each Price: $ Total: $

Manufacturer: Westco

Manufacturer #: BE7001 or equal

Item Notes: Please include the manufacturer and manufacturer number of the
"or equal" in the Notes field for each line item.  If a note with a
different brand is not included, it will be assumed that the
instrument proposed is the specified brand.

Supplier Notes:  

 

 No bid

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)

1.4 Metallophone, Alto, diatonic, with mallets

Quantity: 1 UOM: each Price: $ Total: $

Manufacturer: Studio 49

Manufacturer #: AM1000 or equal

Item Notes: Please include the manufacturer and manufacturer number of the
"or equal" in the Notes field for each line item.  If a note with a
different brand is not included, it will be assumed that the
instrument proposed is the specified brand.

Supplier Notes:  

 

 No bid

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)
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1.5 Metallophone, Deep Bass, diatonic, with mallets

Quantity: 1 UOM: each Price: $ Total: $

Manufacturer: Studio 49

Manufacturer #: BM2000 or equal

Item Notes: Please include the manufacturer and manufacturer number of the
"or equal" in the Notes field for each line item.  If a note with a
different brand is not included, it will be assumed that the
instrument proposed is the specified brand.

Supplier Notes:  

 

 No bid

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)

1.6 Metallophone, Soprano, diatonic, with mallets

Quantity: 1 UOM: each Price: $ Total: $

Manufacturer: Studio 49

Manufacturer #: SM1000 or equal

Item Notes: Please include the manufacturer and manufacturer number of the
"or equal" in the Notes field for each line item.  If a note with a
different brand is not included, it will be assumed that the
instrument proposed is the specified brand.

Supplier Notes:  

 

 No bid

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)

1.7 Xylophone, Alto, diatonic, with mallets

Quantity: 1 UOM: each Price: $ Total: $

Manufacturer: Studio 49

Manufacturer #: AXG2000 or equal

Item Notes: Please include the manufacturer and manufacturer number of the
"or equal" in the Notes field for each line item.  If a note with a
different brand is not included, it will be assumed that the
instrument proposed is the specified brand.

Supplier Notes:  

 

 No bid

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)

1.8 Xylophone, Deep Bass, diatonic, with mallets

Quantity: 1 UOM: each Price: $ Total: $

Manufacturer: Studio 49

Manufacturer #: BXG2000 or equal

Item Notes: Please include the manufacturer and manufacturer number of the
"or equal" in the Notes field for each line item.  If a note with a
different brand is not included, it will be assumed that the
instrument proposed is the specified brand.

Supplier Notes:  

 

 No bid

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)
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1.9 Xylophone, Soprano, diatonic, with mallets

Quantity: 1 UOM: each Price: $ Total: $

Manufacturer: Studio 49

Manufacturer #: SXG2000 or equal

Item Notes: Please include the manufacturer and manufacturer number of the
"or equal" in the Notes field for each line item.  If a note with a
different brand is not included, it will be assumed that the
instrument proposed is the specified brand.

Supplier Notes:  

 

 No bid

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)

1.10 Metallophone, Deep Bass, diatonic, with mallets

Quantity: 1 UOM: each Price: $ Total: $

Manufacturer: Sonor

Manufacturer #: GBKM10 or equal

Item Notes: Please include the manufacturer and manufacturer number of the
"or equal" in the Notes field for each line item.  If a note with a
different brand is not included, it will be assumed that the
instrument proposed is the specified brand.

Supplier Notes:  

 

 No bid

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)

1.11 Metallophone, Alto, diatonic, with mallets

Quantity: 1 UOM: each Price: $ Total: $

Manufacturer: Sonor

Manufacturer #: TAKM10 or equal

Item Notes: Please include the manufacturer and manufacturer number of the
"or equal" in the Notes field for each line item.  If a note with a
different brand is not included, it will be assumed that the
instrument proposed is the specified brand.

Supplier Notes:  

 

 No bid

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)

1.12 Glockenspiel Alto Diatonic

Quantity: 1 UOM: each Price: $ Total: $

Manufacturer: Studio 49

Manufacturer #: AGD 2000 or equal

Item Notes: Please include the manufacturer and manufacturer number of the
"or equal" in the Notes field for each line item.  If a note with a
different brand is not included, it will be assumed that the
instrument proposed is the specified brand.

Supplier Notes:  

 

 No bid

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)
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1.13 Xylophone, Deep Bass, diatonic, with mallets

Quantity: 1 UOM: each Price: $ Total: $

Manufacturer: Sonor

Manufacturer #: GBKX100 or equal

Item Notes: Please include the manufacturer and manufacturer number of the
"or equal" in the Notes field for each line item.  If a note with a
different brand is not included, it will be assumed that the
instrument proposed is the specified brand.

Supplier Notes:  

 

 No bid

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)

1.14 Xylophone, Soprano, diatonic, with mallets

Quantity: 1 UOM: each Price: $ Total: $

Manufacturer: Sonor

Manufacturer #: SKX100 or equal

Item Notes: Please include the manufacturer and manufacturer number of the
"or equal" in the Notes field for each line item.  If a note with a
different brand is not included, it will be assumed that the
instrument proposed is the specified brand.

Supplier Notes:  

 

 No bid

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)

1.15 Boomwhackers, tuned percussion tubes, 5-note chromatic add-on treble set

Quantity: 1 UOM: each Price: $ Total: $

Manufacturer: Boomwhackers

Manufacturer #: BWCG or equal

Item Notes: Please include the manufacturer and manufacturer number of the
"or equal" in the Notes field for each line item.  If a note with a
different brand is not included, it will be assumed that the
instrument proposed is the specified brand.

Supplier Notes:  

 

 No bid

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)

1.16 Boomwhackers, tuned percussion tubes, 7-note bass diatonic set

Quantity: 1 UOM: each Price: $ Total: $

Manufacturer: Boomwhackers

Manufacturer #: BWJG or equal

Item Notes: Please include the manufacturer and manufacturer number of the
"or equal" in the Notes field for each line item.  If a note with a
different brand is not included, it will be assumed that the
instrument proposed is the specified brand.

Supplier Notes:  

 

 No bid

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)
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1.17 Boomwhackers, tuned percussion tubes, 8-note diatonic treble set

Quantity: 1 UOM: each Price: $ Total: $

Manufacturer: Boomwhackers

Manufacturer #: BWDG or equal

Item Notes: Please include the manufacturer and manufacturer number of the
"or equal" in the Notes field for each line item.  If a note with a
different brand is not included, it will be assumed that the
instrument proposed is the specified brand.

Supplier Notes:  

 

 No bid

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)

1.18 Boomwhackers, tuned percussion tubes, treble extension set

Quantity: 1 UOM: each Price: $ Total: $

Manufacturer: Boomwhackers

Manufacturer #: BWEG or equal

Item Notes: Please include the manufacturer and manufacturer number of the
"or equal" in the Notes field for each line item.  If a note with a
different brand is not included, it will be assumed that the
instrument proposed is the specified brand.

Supplier Notes:  

 

 No bid

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)

1.19 Recorder Soprano Angel Black

Quantity: 1 UOM: each Price: $ Total: $

Manufacturer: Angel

Manufacturer #: 101 or equal

Item Notes: Please include the manufacturer and manufacturer number of the
"or equal" in the Notes field for each line item.  If a note with a
different brand is not included, it will be assumed that the
instrument proposed is the specified brand.

Supplier Notes:  

 

 No bid

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)

2 Package Header

Part B - Secondary Winds

Quantity: 1  Total: $

Supplier Notes:  

 
 No bid

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)
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Package Attributes

1. Part B Line Items

This is not a line-item bid.  Instruments listed on the line item tab for Part A are examples of Secondary Winds the
District purchases most often. Purchases utilizing this contract are not limited to the instruments listed. Prices
submitted will be used for evaluation purposes only. After award of this RFP, the schools and departments will
contact the vendors directly for quotes.  Purchasing that exceed $4,999.99 will require three (3) quotes to be
obtained from the awarded vendors. Vendors may be automatically disqualified if they are unable to provide at
least fifty percent (50%) of the instruments in Part B.

 I understand
(Required: Check if applicable)

Package Items

2.1 Amplifier, Bass Guitar

Quantity: 1  Price: $ Total: $

Manufacturer: Fender

Manufacturer #: 2370400000 or equal

Item Notes: Please include the manufacturer and manufacturer number of the
"or equal" in the Notes field for each line item.  If a note with a
different brand is not included, it will be assumed that the
instrument proposed is the specified brand.

Supplier Notes:  

 

 No bid

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)

2.2 Baritone Horn, Marching

Quantity: 1  Price: $ Total: $

Manufacturer: Yamaha

Manufacturer #: YBH-301M or equal

Item Notes: Please include the manufacturer and manufacturer number of the
"or equal" in the Notes field for each line item.  If a note with a
different brand is not included, it will be assumed that the
instrument proposed is the specified brand.

Supplier Notes:  

 

 No bid

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)

2.3 Clarinet, Bass

Quantity: 1  Price: $ Total: $

Manufacturer: Selmer

Manufacturer #: 1430LP or equal

Item Notes: Please include the manufacturer and manufacturer number of the
"or equal" in the Notes field for each line item.  If a note with a
different brand is not included, it will be assumed that the
instrument proposed is the specified brand.

Supplier Notes:  

 

 No bid

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)
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2.4 Cornet, Bb, standard, with mouthpiece and case

Quantity: 1  Price: $ Total: $

Manufacturer: Yamaha

Manufacturer #: YCR-2310III or equal

Item Notes: Please include the manufacturer and manufacturer number of the
"or equal" in the Notes field for each line item.  If a note with a
different brand is not included, it will be assumed that the
instrument proposed is the specified brand.

Supplier Notes:  

 

 No bid

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)

2.5 Euphonium

Quantity: 1  Price: $ Total: $

Manufacturer: Yamaha

Manufacturer #: YEP-201 or equal

Item Notes: Please include the manufacturer and manufacturer number of the
"or equal" in the Notes field for each line item.  If a note with a
different brand is not included, it will be assumed that the
instrument proposed is the specified brand.

Supplier Notes:  

 

 No bid

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)

2.6 Euphonium

Quantity: 1  Price: $ Total: $

Manufacturer: Yamaha

Manufacturer #: YEP-321S or equal

Item Notes: Please include the manufacturer and manufacturer number of the
"or equal" in the Notes field for each line item.  If a note with a
different brand is not included, it will be assumed that the
instrument proposed is the specified brand.

Supplier Notes:  

 

 No bid

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)

2.7 Euphonium, 4-Valve, Gold Lacquer

Quantity: 1  Price: $ Total: $

Manufacturer: Yamaha

Manufacturer #: YEP-321 or equal

Item Notes: Please include the manufacturer and manufacturer number of the
"or equal" in the Notes field for each line item.  If a note with a
different brand is not included, it will be assumed that the
instrument proposed is the specified brand.

Supplier Notes:  

 

 No bid

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)
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2.8 Flugel Horn

Quantity: 1  Price: $ Total: $

Manufacturer: Jupiter

Manufacturer #: JFH1100R or equal

Item Notes: Please include the manufacturer and manufacturer number of the
"or equal" in the Notes field for each line item.  If a note with a
different brand is not included, it will be assumed that the
instrument proposed is the specified brand.

Supplier Notes:  

 

 No bid

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)

2.9 Flute, with case

Quantity: 1  Price: $ Total: $

Manufacturer: Yamaha

Manufacturer #: YFL-222 or equal

Item Notes: Please include the manufacturer and manufacturer number of the
"or equal" in the Notes field for each line item.  If a note with a
different brand is not included, it will be assumed that the
instrument proposed is the specified brand.

Supplier Notes:  

 

 No bid

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)

2.10 French Horn, Double, F/Bb

Quantity: 1  Price: $ Total: $

Manufacturer: Yamaha

Manufacturer #: YHR-668NII or equal

Item Notes: Please include the manufacturer and manufacturer number of the
"or equal" in the Notes field for each line item.  If a note with a
different brand is not included, it will be assumed that the
instrument proposed is the specified brand.

Supplier Notes:  

 

 No bid

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)

2.11 French Horn, Single, Bb

Quantity: 1  Price: $ Total: $

Manufacturer: Yamaha

Manufacturer #: YHR-322II or equal

Item Notes: Please include the manufacturer and manufacturer number of the
"or equal" in the Notes field for each line item.  If a note with a
different brand is not included, it will be assumed that the
instrument proposed is the specified brand.

Supplier Notes:  

 

 No bid

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)
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2.12 French Horn, Single, F

Quantity: 1  Price: $ Total: $

Manufacturer: Yamaha

Manufacturer #: YHR-314II or equal

Item Notes: Please include the manufacturer and manufacturer number of the
"or equal" in the Notes field for each line item.  If a note with a
different brand is not included, it will be assumed that the
instrument proposed is the specified brand.

Supplier Notes:  

 

 No bid

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)

2.13 Piccolo

Quantity: 1  Price: $ Total: $

Manufacturer: Yamaha

Manufacturer #: YPC-32 or equal

Item Notes: Please include the manufacturer and manufacturer number of the
"or equal" in the Notes field for each line item.  If a note with a
different brand is not included, it will be assumed that the
instrument proposed is the specified brand.

Supplier Notes:  

 

 No bid

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)

2.14 Saxophone, Alto, Eb

Quantity: 1  Price: $ Total: $

Manufacturer: Yamaha

Manufacturer #: YAS-26 or equal

Item Notes: Please include the manufacturer and manufacturer number of the
"or equal" in the Notes field for each line item.  If a note with a
different brand is not included, it will be assumed that the
instrument proposed is the specified brand.

Supplier Notes:  

 

 No bid

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)

2.15 Trombone, Bass

Quantity: 1  Price: $ Total: $

Manufacturer: Yamaha

Manufacturer #: YBL-830 Xeno or equal

Item Notes: Please include the manufacturer and manufacturer number of the
"or equal" in the Notes field for each line item.  If a note with a
different brand is not included, it will be assumed that the
instrument proposed is the specified brand.

Supplier Notes:  

 

 No bid

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)

Deadline: 10/21/2022 01:30 PM (CT) 23-009-SB Addendum 1Page 16 of 32 pages



2.16 Trombone, Student

Quantity: 1  Price: $ Total: $

Manufacturer: Yamaha

Manufacturer #: YSL-354 or equal

Item Notes: Please include the manufacturer and manufacturer number of the
"or equal" in the Notes field for each line item.  If a note with a
different brand is not included, it will be assumed that the
instrument proposed is the specified brand.

Supplier Notes:  

 

 No bid

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)

2.17 Trombone, Tenor

Quantity: 1  Price: $ Total: $

Manufacturer: Yamaha

Manufacturer #: YSL-448G or equal

Item Notes: Please include the manufacturer and manufacturer number of the
"or equal" in the Notes field for each line item.  If a note with a
different brand is not included, it will be assumed that the
instrument proposed is the specified brand.

Supplier Notes:  

 

 No bid

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)

2.18 Trumpet, Bb

Quantity: 1  Price: $ Total: $

Manufacturer: Yamaha

Manufacturer #: YTR-2330 or equal

Item Notes: Please include the manufacturer and manufacturer number of the
"or equal" in the Notes field for each line item.  If a note with a
different brand is not included, it will be assumed that the
instrument proposed is the specified brand.

Supplier Notes:  

 

 No bid

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)

2.19 Tuba, BBb

Quantity: 1  Price: $ Total: $

Manufacturer: Yamaha

Manufacturer #: YBB-105WC or equal

Item Notes: Please include the manufacturer and manufacturer number of the
"or equal" in the Notes field for each line item.  If a note with a
different brand is not included, it will be assumed that the
instrument proposed is the specified brand.

Supplier Notes:  

 

 No bid

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)
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Quantity: 1  Total: $

Supplier Notes:  

 
 No bid

 Alternate specification
(Attach separate sheet)

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)

Package Attributes

1. Part C Line Items

This is not a line-item bid.  Instruments listed on the line item tab for Part A are examples of Secondary
Percussion the District purchases most often. Purchases utilizing this contract are not limited to the instruments
listed. Prices submitted will be used for evaluation purposes only. After award of this RFP, the schools and
departments will contact the vendors directly for quotes.  Purchasing that exceed $4,999.99 will require three (3)
quotes to be obtained from the awarded vendors. Vendors may be automatically disqualified if they are unable to
provide at least fifty percent (50%) of the instruments in Part C.

 I understand
(Required: Check if applicable)

Package Items

3.1 Vibraphone, 3-octave, anodized silver bars, with cover and field-type frame

Quantity: 1  Price: $ Total: $

Manufacturer: Adams

Manufacturer #: VCSF30M or equal

Item Notes: Please include the manufacturer and manufacturer number of the
"or equal" in the Notes field for each line item.  If a note with a
different brand is not included, it will be assumed that the
instrument proposed is the specified brand.

Supplier Notes:  

 

 No bid

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)

3.2 Drum Stadium Hardware, Bass, Pearl

Quantity: 1  Price: $ Total: $

Manufacturer: Pearl

Manufacturer #: MBS-3000 or equal

Item Notes: Please include the manufacturer and manufacturer number of the
"or equal" in the Notes field for each line item.  If a note with a
different brand is not included, it will be assumed that the
instrument proposed is the specified brand.

Supplier Notes:  

 

 No bid

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)
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3.3 Drum Stadium Hardware, Tenors, Pearl

Quantity: 1  Price: $ Total: $

Manufacturer: Pearl

Manufacturer #: MTS-3000 or equal

Item Notes: Please include the manufacturer and manufacturer number of the
"or equal" in the Notes field for each line item.  If a note with a
different brand is not included, it will be assumed that the
instrument proposed is the specified brand.

Supplier Notes:  

 

 No bid

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)

3.4 Marimba, Concert, for field use, 4.3 octave, synthetic bars, with field-type frame

Quantity: 1  Price: $ Total: $

Manufacturer: Adams

Manufacturer #: MCKF43 or equal

Item Notes: Please include the manufacturer and manufacturer number of the
"or equal" in the Notes field for each line item.  If a note with a
different brand is not included, it will be assumed that the
instrument proposed is the specified brand.

Supplier Notes:  

 

 No bid

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)

3.5 Timpani, individual drum: 20, with tuning gauge and cover

Quantity: 1  Price: $ Total: $

Manufacturer: Yamaha

Manufacturer #: TP-6320CL or equal

Item Notes: Please include the manufacturer and manufacturer number of the
"or equal" in the Notes field for each line item.  If a note with a
different brand is not included, it will be assumed that the
instrument proposed is the specified brand.

Supplier Notes:  

 

 No bid

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)

3.6 Timpani, individual drum: 23, with tuning gauge and cover

Quantity: 1  Price: $ Total: $

Manufacturer: Yamaha

Manufacturer #: TP-6323CL or equal

Item Notes: Please include the manufacturer and manufacturer number of the
"or equal" in the Notes field for each line item.  If a note with a
different brand is not included, it will be assumed that the
instrument proposed is the specified brand.

Supplier Notes:  

 

 No bid

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)
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3.7 Timpani, individual drum: 23, with tuning gauge and cover

Quantity: 1  Price: $ Total: $

Manufacturer: Yamaha

Manufacturer #: TP-4323CL or equal

Item Notes: Please include the manufacturer and manufacturer number of the
"or equal" in the Notes field for each line item.  If a note with a
different brand is not included, it will be assumed that the
instrument proposed is the specified brand.

Supplier Notes:  

 

 No bid

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)

3.8 Timpani, individual drum: 26, with tuning gauge and cover

Quantity: 1  Price: $ Total: $

Manufacturer: Yamaha

Manufacturer #: TP-4326CL or equal

Item Notes: Please include the manufacturer and manufacturer number of the
"or equal" in the Notes field for each line item.  If a note with a
different brand is not included, it will be assumed that the
instrument proposed is the specified brand.

Supplier Notes:  

 

 No bid

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)

3.9 Timpani, individual drum: 29, with tuning gauge and cover

Quantity: 1  Price: $ Total: $

Manufacturer: Yamaha

Manufacturer #: TP-6329CL or equal

Item Notes: Please include the manufacturer and manufacturer number of the
"or equal" in the Notes field for each line item.  If a note with a
different brand is not included, it will be assumed that the
instrument proposed is the specified brand.

Supplier Notes:  

 

 No bid

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)

3.10 Timpani, individual drum: 29, with tuning gauge and cover

Quantity: 1  Price: $ Total: $

Manufacturer: Yamaha

Manufacturer #: TP-4329CL or equal

Item Notes: Please include the manufacturer and manufacturer number of the
"or equal" in the Notes field for each line item.  If a note with a
different brand is not included, it will be assumed that the
instrument proposed is the specified brand.

Supplier Notes:  

 

 No bid

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)
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3.11 Timpani, individual drum: 32, with tuning gauge and cover

Quantity: 1  Price: $ Total: $

Manufacturer: Yamaha

Manufacturer #: TP-6332CL or equal

Item Notes: Please include the manufacturer and manufacturer number of the
"or equal" in the Notes field for each line item.  If a note with a
different brand is not included, it will be assumed that the
instrument proposed is the specified brand.

Supplier Notes:  

 

 No bid

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)

3.12 Timpani, individual drum: 32, with tuning gauge and cover

Quantity: 1  Price: $ Total: $

Manufacturer: Yamaha

Manufacturer #: TP-4332CL or equal

Item Notes: Please include the manufacturer and manufacturer number of the
"or equal" in the Notes field for each line item.  If a note with a
different brand is not included, it will be assumed that the
instrument proposed is the specified brand.

Supplier Notes:  

 

 No bid

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)

3.13 Vibraphone, 3-octave, anodized silver bars, with cover and field-type frame

Quantity: 1  Price: $ Total: $

Manufacturer: Yamaha

Manufacturer #: YVRD2700C or equal

Item Notes: Please include the manufacturer and manufacturer number of the
"or equal" in the Notes field for each line item.  If a note with a
different brand is not included, it will be assumed that the
instrument proposed is the specified brand.

Supplier Notes:  

 

 No bid

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)

3.14 Vibraphone, 3-octave, silver aluminum alloy bars, with stand and cover, with motor

Quantity: 1  Price: $ Total: $

Manufacturer: Yamaha

Manufacturer #: YV-3030MSYVD-20 or equal

Item Notes: Please include the manufacturer and manufacturer number of the
"or equal" in the Notes field for each line item.  If a note with a
different brand is not included, it will be assumed that the
instrument proposed is the specified brand.

Supplier Notes:  

 

 No bid

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)
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3.15 Bells, Concert, with stand

Quantity: 1  Price: $ Total: $

Manufacturer: Yamaha

Manufacturer #: YG250DS70 or equal

Item Notes: Please include the manufacturer and manufacturer number of the
"or equal" in the Notes field for each line item.  If a note with a
different brand is not included, it will be assumed that the
instrument proposed is the specified brand.

Supplier Notes:  

 

 No bid

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)

3.16 Bells, Orchestral, steel, with stand case

Quantity: 1  Price: $ Total: $

Manufacturer: Yamaha

Manufacturer #: YG-1210S70 or equal

Item Notes: Please include the manufacturer and manufacturer number of the
"or equal" in the Notes field for each line item.  If a note with a
different brand is not included, it will be assumed that the
instrument proposed is the specified brand.

Supplier Notes:  

 

 No bid

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)

3.17 Xylophone, 3.5 octave, synthetic bars, with cover field-type frame

Quantity: 1  Price: $ Total: $

Manufacturer: Adams

Manufacturer #: XSKF35 or equal

Item Notes: Please include the manufacturer and manufacturer number of the
"or equal" in the Notes field for each line item.  If a note with a
different brand is not included, it will be assumed that the
instrument proposed is the specified brand.

Supplier Notes:  

 

 No bid

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)

3.18 Drum, Concert Bass, 36, cortex finish, with stand and cover

Quantity: 1  Price: $ Total: $

Manufacturer: Ludwig

Manufacturer #: LE CB86 X8GL2836CB or equal

Item Notes: Please include the manufacturer and manufacturer number of the
"or equal" in the Notes field for each line item.  If a note with a
different brand is not included, it will be assumed that the
instrument proposed is the specified brand.

Supplier Notes:  

 

 No bid

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)
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3.19 Timpani, individual drum: 29 fiberglass, each with tuning gauges and cover

Quantity: 1  Price: $ Total: $

Manufacturer: Ludwig

Manufacturer #: LTS S429 FG with L129TP or equal

Item Notes: Please include the manufacturer and manufacturer number of the
"or equal" in the Notes field for each line item.  If a note with a
different brand is not included, it will be assumed that the
instrument proposed is the specified brand.

Supplier Notes:  

 

 No bid

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)

3.20 Timpani, individual drum: 23, with tuning gauge and cover

Quantity: 1  Price: $ Total: $

Manufacturer: Ludwig

Manufacturer #: LKP523PG with L123TP or equal

Item Notes: Please include the manufacturer and manufacturer number of the
"or equal" in the Notes field for each line item.  If a note with a
different brand is not included, it will be assumed that the
instrument proposed is the specified brand.

Supplier Notes:  

 

 No bid

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)

3.21 Chimes, chrome finish, with cover

Quantity: 1  Price: $ Total: $

Manufacturer: Adams

Manufacturer #: BK 3203C or equal

Item Notes: Please include the manufacturer and manufacturer number of the
"or equal" in the Notes field for each line item.  If a note with a
different brand is not included, it will be assumed that the
instrument proposed is the specified brand.

Supplier Notes:  

 

 No bid

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)

3.22 Xylophone Kit, 2.5 octave with pad, stand bag

Quantity: 1  Price: $ Total: $

Manufacturer: Ludwig

Manufacturer #: LMXYLO or equal

Item Notes: Please include the manufacturer and manufacturer number of the
"or equal" in the Notes field for each line item.  If a note with a
different brand is not included, it will be assumed that the
instrument proposed is the specified brand.

Supplier Notes:  

 

 No bid

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)
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3.23 Bells, Orchestral, steel, with stand case

Quantity: 1  Price: $ Total: $

Manufacturer: Musser

Manufacturer #: M646 or equal

Item Notes: Please include the manufacturer and manufacturer number of the
"or equal" in the Notes field for each line item.  If a note with a
different brand is not included, it will be assumed that the
instrument proposed is the specified brand.

Supplier Notes:  

 

 No bid

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)

3.24 Marimba, Concert, 5 octave, rosewood bars, with stand cover

Quantity: 1  Price: $ Total: $

Manufacturer: Adams

Manufacturer #: MAHF50 or equal

Item Notes: Please include the manufacturer and manufacturer number of the
"or equal" in the Notes field for each line item.  If a note with a
different brand is not included, it will be assumed that the
instrument proposed is the specified brand.

Supplier Notes:  

 

 No bid

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)

3.25 Chimes, chrome finish, with cover

Quantity: 1  Price: $ Total: $

Manufacturer: Musser

Manufacturer #: M661C with MUS-M637 or equal

Item Notes: Please include the manufacturer and manufacturer number of the
"or equal" in the Notes field for each line item.  If a note with a
different brand is not included, it will be assumed that the
instrument proposed is the specified brand.

Supplier Notes:  

 

 No bid

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)

3.26 Drum, Marching Bass, individual drums: 16, with Air Frame Carrier and case

Quantity: 1  Price: $ Total: $

Manufacturer: Pearl

Manufacturer #: PBDM1614/AXCN46 or equal

Item Notes: Please include the manufacturer and manufacturer number of the
"or equal" in the Notes field for each line item.  If a note with a
different brand is not included, it will be assumed that the
instrument proposed is the specified brand.

Supplier Notes:  

 

 No bid

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)
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3.27 Drum, Marching Bass, individual drums: 18, with Air Frame Carrier and case

Quantity: 1  Price: $ Total: $

Manufacturer: Pearl

Manufacturer #: PBDM1814/AXCN46 or equal

Item Notes: Please include the manufacturer and manufacturer number of the
"or equal" in the Notes field for each line item.  If a note with a
different brand is not included, it will be assumed that the
instrument proposed is the specified brand.

Supplier Notes:  

 

 No bid

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)

3.28 Drum, Field, 14x10", Symphonic, 2.3 mm hoops, Trio Strainer, Concert Black

Quantity: 1  Price: $ Total: $

Manufacturer: Black Swamp

Manufacturer #: SA1014MSTCB or equal

Item Notes: Please include the manufacturer and manufacturer number of the
"or equal" in the Notes field for each line item.  If a note with a
different brand is not included, it will be assumed that the
instrument proposed is the specified brand.

Supplier Notes:  

 

 No bid

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)

3.29 Drum, Marching Bass, individual drums: 20, with Air Frame Carrier and case

Quantity: 1  Price: $ Total: $

Manufacturer: Pearl

Manufacturer #: PBDM2014/AXCN46 or equal

Item Notes: Please include the manufacturer and manufacturer number of the
"or equal" in the Notes field for each line item.  If a note with a
different brand is not included, it will be assumed that the
instrument proposed is the specified brand.

Supplier Notes:  

 

 No bid

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)

3.30 Drum, Marching Bass, individual drums: 22, with Air Frame Carrier and case

Quantity: 1  Price: $ Total: $

Manufacturer: Pearl

Manufacturer #: PBDM2214/AXCN46 or equal

Item Notes: Please include the manufacturer and manufacturer number of the
"or equal" in the Notes field for each line item.  If a note with a
different brand is not included, it will be assumed that the
instrument proposed is the specified brand.

Supplier Notes:  

 

 No bid

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)
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3.31 Drum, Marching Bass, individual drums: 24, with Air Frame Carrier and case

Quantity: 1  Price: $ Total: $

Manufacturer: Pearl

Manufacturer #: PBDM2414/AXCN46 or equal

Item Notes: Please include the manufacturer and manufacturer number of the
"or equal" in the Notes field for each line item.  If a note with a
different brand is not included, it will be assumed that the
instrument proposed is the specified brand.

Supplier Notes:  

 

 No bid

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)

3.32 Drum, Marching Bass, individual drums: 26, with Air Frame Carrier and case

Quantity: 1  Price: $ Total: $

Manufacturer: Pearl

Manufacturer #: PBDM2614/AXCN46 or equal

Item Notes: Please include the manufacturer and manufacturer number of the
"or equal" in the Notes field for each line item.  If a note with a
different brand is not included, it will be assumed that the
instrument proposed is the specified brand.

Supplier Notes:  

 

 No bid

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)

3.33 Drum, Marching Bass, individual drums: 28, with Air Frame Carrier and case

Quantity: 1  Price: $ Total: $

Manufacturer: Pearl

Manufacturer #: PBDM2814/AXCN46 or equal

Item Notes: Please include the manufacturer and manufacturer number of the
"or equal" in the Notes field for each line item.  If a note with a
different brand is not included, it will be assumed that the
instrument proposed is the specified brand.

Supplier Notes:  

 

 No bid

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)

3.34 Drum, Marching Bass, individual drums: 30", with Air Frame Carrier and case

Quantity: 1  Price: $ Total: $

Manufacturer: Pearl

Manufacturer #: PBDM3016/AXCN46 or equal

Item Notes: Please include the manufacturer and manufacturer number of the
"or equal" in the Notes field for each line item.  If a note with a
different brand is not included, it will be assumed that the
instrument proposed is the specified brand.

Supplier Notes:  

 

 No bid

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)

4 Package Header

Part D - Strings
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Quantity: 1  Total: $

Supplier Notes:  

 
 No bid

 Alternate specification
(Attach separate sheet)

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)

Package Attributes

1. Part D Line Items

This is not a line-item bid.  Instruments listed on the line item tab for Part A are examples of String Instruments
the District purchases most often. Purchases utilizing this contract are not limited to the instruments listed. Prices
submitted will be used for evaluation purposes only. After award of this RFP, the schools and departments will
contact the vendors directly for quotes.  Purchasing that exceed $4,999.99 will require three (3) quotes to be
obtained from the awarded vendors. Vendors may be automatically disqualified if they are unable to provide at
least fifty percent (50%) of the instruments in Part D.

 I understand
(Required: Check if applicable)

Package Items

4.1 Upright Bass, complete outfit with bow and bag, all sizes (beginner) size: 1/4-3/4

Quantity: 1  Price: $ Total: $

Manufacturer: Scherl & Roth

Manufacturer #: SR46E2CFH or equal

Item Notes: Please include the manufacturer and manufacturer number of the
"or equal" in the Notes field for each line item.  If a note with a
different brand is not included, it will be assumed that the
instrument proposed is the specified brand.

Supplier Notes:  

 

 No bid

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)

4.2 Cello, complete outfit with bow and bag, all sizes (intermediate) size: 4/4

Quantity: 1  Price: $ Total: $

Manufacturer: Yamaha

Manufacturer #: AVC7 SG or equal

Item Notes: Please include the manufacturer and manufacturer number of the
"or equal" in the Notes field for each line item.  If a note with a
different brand is not included, it will be assumed that the
instrument proposed is the specified brand.

Supplier Notes:  

 

 No bid

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)
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4.3 Viola, complete outfit with bow and case, all sizes (beginner)

Quantity: 1  Price: $ Total: $

Manufacturer: Yamaha

Manufacturer #: AVA5-S or equal

Item Notes: Please include the manufacturer and manufacturer number of the
"or equal" in the Notes field for each line item.  If a note with a
different brand is not included, it will be assumed that the
instrument proposed is the specified brand.

Supplier Notes:  

 

 No bid

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)

4.4 Viola, complete outfit with bow and case, sizes: 15, 15.5, 16"

Quantity: 1  Price: $ Total: $

Manufacturer: Yamaha

Manufacturer #: AVA7-S or equal

Item Notes: Please include the manufacturer and manufacturer number of the
"or equal" in the Notes field for each line item.  If a note with a
different brand is not included, it will be assumed that the
instrument proposed is the specified brand.

Supplier Notes:  

 

 No bid

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)

4.5 Bow, Cello, fiberglass, horsehair

Quantity: 1  Price: $ Total: $

Manufacturer: Glasser

Manufacturer #: 401H or equal

Item Notes: Please include the manufacturer and manufacturer number of the
"or equal" in the Notes field for each line item.  If a note with a
different brand is not included, it will be assumed that the
instrument proposed is the specified brand.

Supplier Notes:  

 

 No bid

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)

4.6 Bow, Viola, fiberglass, horsehair

Quantity: 1  Price: $ Total: $

Manufacturer: Glasser

Manufacturer #: 301H or equal

Item Notes: Please include the manufacturer and manufacturer number of the
"or equal" in the Notes field for each line item.  If a note with a
different brand is not included, it will be assumed that the
instrument proposed is the specified brand.

Supplier Notes:  

 

 No bid

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)
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4.7 Guitar, Bass, Electric w/Patch Cord and Hard Shell Case - Specify Color.

Quantity: 1  Price: $ Total: $

Manufacturer: Fender

Manufacturer #: Player Series Precision Bass or equal

Item Notes: Please include the manufacturer and manufacturer number of the
"or equal" in the Notes field for each line item.  If a note with a
different brand is not included, it will be assumed that the
instrument proposed is the specified brand.

Supplier Notes:  

 

 No bid

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)

4.8 Bow, Bass, French Style, Composite Shaft, Ebony Frog, Leather Grip, Nickle Silver Winding, Horse Hair, 3/4
Size.

Quantity: 1  Price: $ Total: $

Manufacturer: Howard Core

Manufacturer #: 1088DB-F2 or equal

Item Notes: Please include the manufacturer and manufacturer number of the
"or equal" in the Notes field for each line item.  If a note with a
different brand is not included, it will be assumed that the
instrument proposed is the specified brand.

Supplier Notes:  

 

 No bid

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)

4.9 Bow, Bass, German Style, Composite Shaft, Ebony Frog, Leather Grip, Nickle Silver Winding, Horse Hair, 3/4
Size.

Quantity: 1  Price: $ Total: $

Manufacturer: Howard Core

Manufacturer #: 1088DB-G2 or equal

Item Notes: Please include the manufacturer and manufacturer number of the
"or equal" in the Notes field for each line item.  If a note with a
different brand is not included, it will be assumed that the
instrument proposed is the specified brand.

Supplier Notes:  

 

 No bid

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)

4.10 Bow, Viola, Composite Shaft, Ebony Frog, Leather Grip, Nickle Silver Winding, Horse Hair, Full Size.

Quantity: 1  Price: $ Total: $

Manufacturer: Howard Core

Manufacturer #: 1088VA-1 or equal

Item Notes: Please include the manufacturer and manufacturer number of the
"or equal" in the Notes field for each line item.  If a note with a
different brand is not included, it will be assumed that the
instrument proposed is the specified brand.

Supplier Notes:  

 

 No bid

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)
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4.11 Guitar, full scale classical with case and strap

Quantity: 1  Price: $ Total: $

Manufacturer: Yamaha

Manufacturer #: C40II or equal

Item Notes: Please include the manufacturer and manufacturer number of the
"or equal" in the Notes field for each line item.  If a note with a
different brand is not included, it will be assumed that the
instrument proposed is the specified brand.

Supplier Notes:  

 

 No bid

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)

4.12 Bow, Cello, Horse Hair, Full Size

Quantity: 1  Price: $ Total: $

Manufacturer: Howard Core

Manufacturer #: 1088VC-1 or equal

Item Notes: Please include the manufacturer and manufacturer number of the
"or equal" in the Notes field for each line item.  If a note with a
different brand is not included, it will be assumed that the
instrument proposed is the specified brand.

Supplier Notes:  

 

 No bid

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)

4.13 Bow, Violin, Horse Hair, Full Size

Quantity: 1  Price: $ Total: $

Manufacturer: Howard Core

Manufacturer #: 1088VN-1 or equal

Item Notes: Please include the manufacturer and manufacturer number of the
"or equal" in the Notes field for each line item.  If a note with a
different brand is not included, it will be assumed that the
instrument proposed is the specified brand.

Supplier Notes:  

 

 No bid

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)

4.14 Cello, Beginner, w/Bow and bag, all sizes

Quantity: 1  Price: $ Total: $

Manufacturer: Yamaha

Manufacturer #: AVC5-S or equal

Item Notes: Please include the manufacturer and manufacturer number of the
"or equal" in the Notes field for each line item.  If a note with a
different brand is not included, it will be assumed that the
instrument proposed is the specified brand.

Supplier Notes:  

 

 No bid

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)
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4.15 Guitar, Electric, Pacifica Series with case, cord, strap and pick

Quantity: 1  Price: $ Total: $

Manufacturer: Yamaha

Manufacturer #: PAC212VQM or equal

Item Notes: Please include the manufacturer and manufacturer number of the
"or equal" in the Notes field for each line item.  If a note with a
different brand is not included, it will be assumed that the
instrument proposed is the specified brand.

Supplier Notes:  

 

 No bid

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)

4.16 Guitar, Student, with case

Quantity: 1  Price: $ Total: $

Manufacturer: Yamaha

Manufacturer #: CGS103AII or equal

Item Notes: Please include the manufacturer and manufacturer number of the
"or equal" in the Notes field for each line item.  If a note with a
different brand is not included, it will be assumed that the
instrument proposed is the specified brand.

Supplier Notes:  

 

 No bid

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)

4.17 Violin, complete with bow and bag

Quantity: 1  Price: $ Total: $

Manufacturer: Yamaha

Manufacturer #: AV5 or equal

Item Notes: Please include the manufacturer and manufacturer number of the
"or equal" in the Notes field for each line item.  If a note with a
different brand is not included, it will be assumed that the
instrument proposed is the specified brand.

Supplier Notes:  

 

 No bid

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)
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Supplier Information

Company Name:

Contact Name:

Address:

 

 

 

Phone:

Fax:

Email:

Supplier Notes

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

By submitting your response, you certify that you are authorized to represent and bind your company.

Print Name Signature
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